OFFICE SUPPLIES & FINE COPY PAPER # 2021-394-02

APPENDIX B - RATES

Supplier: Staples Canada ULC, doing business as Staples Professional
Category A - Price List Effective Date: April 18, 2025

Category B - Price List Effective Date: April 18, 2025

Master Agreement Start Date: February 18, 2022

Master Agreement Expiry Date: February 17, 2026

For rates unique to your requirements, please contact your supplier or OECM Customer Support Team
for more information or use the Second Stage Selection Process available for this agreement.

Please contact supplier representative on product specifications, availability and pricing on products/services.
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Category A - Hybrid Savings - EDLOP
Category B - Fine Copy Paper Core Products
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Category B - Fine Copy Paper Colour List
Supplier and OECM Contact Information

Staples Canada ULC, doing business as Staples Professional OECM
Jamil Dibe 1-844-OECM-900 (1-844-632-6900)
(416) 904-3423 customersupport@oecm.ca
jamil.dibe@staples.com https://oecm.ca/marketplace/office-supplies-and-fine-copy-paper

The information contained in this document is confidential and proprietary to OECM. Unauthorized distribution or use of this document or the information contained herein is prohibited.
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APPENDIX B - RATES
Supplier: Staples Canada ULC, doing business as Staples Professional
Category A - Price List Effective Date: April 18, 2025
Master Agreement Start Date: February 18, 2022
Master Agreement Expiry Date: February 17, 2026
For Colleges, Universiis. and other Broader Publi Sector organizations interested in K-12 products, please contact your Staples representaive to have those items added onto your core st
P P HP. 7WO73ARABA HEW7WO73AAABA HP POLY CS540A DECT 1920-1930 307.
P P Logiech 981000014 LOGI81000014 HEAD SET,LOGITECH,COMFORT USB
P P Data Accessories Corp. MP107BLK DACMP107BLK MONITOR STAND, STANDARD
mputer Supi FELLOWES 48121 FEL48121 FOOTREST, ADJUSTABLE
mputer Supi ogitech 981000507 LOG81000507 H340 HEADSET W/ MIC
mputer Supi ogitech 920012059 L0G920012059 KEYBOARD WAVE COMBO MK550 o
mputer Sup erbatim 9739 WEDYVG001088 WD 178 PASSPORT BLACK o
mputer Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY 17649 STP17649 POWER BAR 6 OUTLET, 15" CORD o bl
mputer Sup ogitech 980000382 LOG980000362 SPEAKER WITH MP3 PLATFORM o
mputer Sup erbatim 95236 VER95236 FLASH DRIVE STORE N GO4GB o
mputer Supi ogitect 910001439 L0G910001439 MOUSE OPTICAL WIRED,B100
mputer Sup Sandis CZ60032GB35S SSXCZ60032GB355 ‘GLIDE USB FLASH DRIVE 3268
mputer Sup Falcon Safety-Air Duster DPSXLCNG FALDPSXLCNG ELECTRONIC DUSTER DUST OFF.10
mputer Sup Falcon Safety-Ar Duster DPSXLCN FALDPSXLCN AIR DUSTER DUST OFF 10 0Z
mputer Supi THE STAPLES COMPANY 23420 STP23420 WIRELESS MOUSE BLACK
mputer Sup Davis Group 230408 RG0230408 DAVIS GROUP D RING BINDER 2" B
P P THE STAPLES COMPANY 17651 STP17651 POWER BAR 6 OUTLET.6' CORD
P P THE STAPLES COMPANY 18259 STP18259 MOUSEPAD/WRISTREST,BLUE CR 1
Computer Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 18265 STP18265 MOUSE PAD/WRISTREST PURPLE CR 1 o 12
mputer Sup MW3TOLE MMMMW310LE MOUSE PAD GEL WRIST REST 16
mputer Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY 18257 STP18257 MOUSE PAD WRISTREST,COMBO,BK 74
mputer Sup Brother Int Canada Ltd FAX2840 BRTFAX2840 FAX,2840, MONO LASER 315
mputer Sup Cyber Acoustics AC104 CYAACT04 UNIVERSAL HEADSET,MONO X
P P Verbatim 95507 VER95507 FLASH DRIVE,STORE N GO,8GB
P P Microsoft Corp. D5000003 STP23420 WIRELESS MOUSE BLACK
P P ogitech 920002836 L0G920002836 KEYBOARD & MOUSE MK320 P
mputer Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY 54311 NXTNX54311 NXT 2PK 60UTL 2.5 SURGE WH 1
mputer Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY NX54315 NXTNX54315 NXT 60UTL 6' 900J 2 USB SURGE 2
mputer Supi ogitech 960000694 LOGI60000694 C270 WEBCAM, BLACK, USB 2.0 o 34
mputer Sup erbatim 96317 VER96317 FLASH DRIVE STORE N GO,16GB o
mputer Sup FELLOWES 8038101 FELB036101 RISER MONITOR BLACK o
mputer Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY 22129 STP22129 INDOOR EXTENSION CORD,25” o
mputer Sup ICLOTH ICA100 ICHICA100 WIPES, ICLOTH, LARGE, 100/PK 700 o
mputer Supi erbatim 97005 VER97005 FLASH DRIVE STORE N GO .64GB
mputer Sup FELLOWES 9140301 FEL9140301 KEYBOARD DRAWER
mputer Sup ogitech 980000802 LOGY980000802 7150 MULTIMEDIA SPEAKER
mputer Sup Kensington 72354 KMW72354 WIRELESS OPTICAL MOUSE,BLACK .
mputer Sup Brother Int Canada Ltd DR350 BRTDR350 DRUM,FOR HL2040/2070N 160
mputer Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY NX54318 NXTNX54318 NXT 10 OUTL 6 2USB SURGE WH .
P P Logitech 920002478 L0G920002478 KEYBOARD.K120,ENGLISH
P P ‘American Power Conversion PBGT APWPBGT POWER BAR,8 OUTLET
P P Targus 953GL TRGTSBIS3GL 17.3" TARGUS VOYAGER Il BKPK
P P Holiday Luggage Inc SWA0506 HLUSWAQ506 BAG,POLYTEX,WENGER BLACK
mputer Sup Kensington 72370 KMW72370 WIRELESS MOUSE PROFIT
mputer Supi Nxt Technologies NX54319 NXTNX54319 NXT 120UTL 8 3900) 2USB SURGE o 44,
mputer Sup Kensington 72426 KMW72426 JOYSTICK WIRELESS PRESENTER o 94,
mputer Sup Kensington 72369 KMW72369 MOUSE,PROFIT USB WIRED o 24
mputer Sup APC PE6UZ APWPEGUZ SURGE PROTECTOR 6 OUTLETS o 39
mputer Sup Nxt Technologies NX61205 NXTNX61205 NXT 16GB USB 2.0 2PK ADD2023 o 12
mputer Sup Logitech 910002974 L0G910006625 LOGITECH M3255 MOUSE (BLACK) o 33,94
mputer Supi THE STAPLES COMPANY 15735 STP15735 ADDING ROLLS 2 1/4°X 125" il
mputer Sup Kensington 64370 KMW64370 KEYBOARD.FOR LIFE.ENGLISH
mputer Sup The Staples Company 10365 MAX648250 CDR48X,80MINUTES, 700M8
mputer Sup The Staples Company 10366 MAX648200 CDR48X,80MINUTES, 700M8 100
mputer Sup The Staples Company 13164 MAX639013 DVD+R4.7GB
mputer Sup Tripp Lite TLPTR TRITLP74R NO BID (MKtPlace or Apple)
P i Verbatim 49173 VER49173 USB FLASH DRIVE KEY,32GB
P P THE STAPLES COMPANY 22130 STP22130 INDOOR EXTENSION CORD, 15~
P P HP 783Q1AAABA HEW783Q1AAABA HP POLY ENCOREPRO 510
P P Verbatim 49172 VER49172 USB FLASH DRIVE KEY,16GB
mputer Supi Cyber Acoustics CA3090 CYACA3090 NO BID (MKtPlace or Apple)
mputer Supi erbatim 97540 VER97540 MOUSE, MINI TRAVEL RED o
mputer Supi THE STAPLES COMPANY 22131 STP22131 INDOOR EXTENSION CORD 6 o
mputer Sup erbatim 97706 VER97706 USB,3.0UNIVERSAL CARD READER o
mputer Sup erbatim 96871 VER96871 NO BID (MktPlace or Apple) o
mputer Supi hoosh 31030C WHH31030C NO BID (MktPlace or Apple) o
mputer Supi Maxell 638014 MAX638014 X X 700
mputer Supi Belkin Corporation BE10820006 BLKBE10820006 NO BID (MktPlace or Apple) 1
mputer Sup Cyber Acoustics ACM7002 CYAACM7002 'HEADPHONE, CLASSROOM K-12 1
mputer Sup Maxell 639016 MAX639016 DVD+RA4.7GB,16X 100
mputer Sup Kensington 64068 KMW64068 SECURITY SYSTEM.MICROSAVER
mputer Sup Maxell 190318 MAX190318 NO BID (MKtPlace or Apple)
7 mputer Sup Verbatim 49171 VER49171 USB FLASH DRIVE 8GB.
7 P P Verbatim 96806 VER96806 FLASH DRIVE STORE N GO,32GB
P P Verbatim 95098 VER95098 NO BID (MKtPlace or Apple)
P Maxell 648250 MAX648250 CDR,#8X,80MINUTES, 700MB
mputer Supy Maxell 648200 MAX648200 CDR,48X,80MINUTES, 700M8 100
mputer Su Verbatim 96808 VER96808 FLASH MEMORY CARD, 16GB 1
aciity Supplies Kimberly Clark 21400 KCI21400 FACIAL TISSUE,100SHEETS 36 o
acility Supplies GOJO 965212CANO0 GOJ965212CANOD ‘SANITIZER PURELL,236ML i o
acility Supplies Clorox C/O Plus 1169 CXs1169 WIPE DISINFEC FRESH SCENT 75 o
aciity Supplies Wasip Ltd F1504760 WASF1504760 BANDAGE FAB,7.56X2CM 100 o
acility Supplies Kimberly Clark 21606 KCI21606 FACIAL TISSUE, 125 SHEETS o
aciity Supplies Kimberly Clark 121340 KCI21340 FACIAL TISSUE,SURPASS, 100SHT
acilty Supplies Dudley Inc DYRP7SP. DUDDYRP7SP PADLOCK,COMBINATION
acilty Supplies E cs203 MMMCS203 BANDAGES ASSORTED 80CT
acility Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 16523 STP16523 BLUE ADHESIVE PUTTY 56GRAM E
acilty Supplies Kimberly Clark 03076 KCI03076 FACIAL TISSUE KLEENEX,2PLY,WE il 18,
acility Supplies Wasip Ltd F1570760 WASF1570760 BANDAGE PLASTIC.2X7.5CM B 100 R
aciity Supplies HONEYWELL HCE2108C KAZHCE2108C HEATER,CORE CERAMIC 54,
acilly Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 357758 STP357758 MASKING TAPE. 18MMX55,
acilly Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 30968 STP30968 “TAPE CLEAR 48MMX50M 1
acity Supples E 37106PK STP30968 TAPE CLEAR 48MMX50M bl
acility Supplies Innocore Sales. C12504 1SMC12504 REFILL FOAMING HAND WASH 3
acility Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 468413 STP468413 MASKING TAPE 24MMX55M
acility Supplies £ 230824 MMM230824 “TAPE MASKING, 24MMX55M o
100 acility Supplies Unisource Canada inc. 122636 UNO122636 'STICKS, POPSICLE WOODEN 4-1/2" 1000 o
101 acility Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 74471 AVE74471 BADGE HOLDER,3X4 25 o bl
102 acility Supplies aw 202048 MMM202048 TAPE MASKING,SCOTCH,48MMX55M i o
103 aclity Supplies POLAR PAK 122131 UNO122131 COMPOST STRAWS 8" ASSORTED 400 o
104 acility Supplies Vib Marketing 6124 VMK1240 MAGNETIC TAPE 1X120" 1
105 acity Supplies M 230848 MMM230848 TAPE MASKING.48MMX55M 1 1
106 aciity Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 3597: STP35973 CLEAR TAPE 48MMX50M B 36
107 aciity Supplies E 230836 MMM230836 TAPE MASKING,36MMX55M 1 Y
108 aciity Supplies The Staples Company 60961 STP6096T MAILER BUBBLE #5 10.5X16 100 100 28.
109 acility Supplies Rubbermaid 295673BLUE RUB295673BLUE WASTEBASKET,RECYCLED BLUE 10
110 acilly Supplies The Staples Company CW908740G12 CWPCW908740G12 P53 DISHWASHING LIQUID 740ML
111 aclity Supplies M 230818 MMM230818 “TAPE MASKING, 18MNX55M
112 aciity Supplies Conros Corporation 48621 CNS48621 TWINE, WHITE NYLON, 250"
113 acility Supplies 3w 205524NP MMM205524NP TAPE MASKING,ECO,24MMX55M,2055
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Supplier: Staples Canada ULC, doing business as Staples Professional
For Colleges, Universties, interested in K-12 products, please contact your Stap o have those item core st
4 upplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 861! 619 MAILER PADDED # 7 14-1/4X20/10 PACK 0 1a.
acility Supples Cascades K085 CCDKO08S SELECT KITCHEN TWL 85SHT CARTON 30 39,
acility Supplies The Staples Company 60957 TP60957 MAILER BUBBLE #17.25X12 /100 BOX 100 o 21
acility Supplies FELLOWES 945000 945000 AERAMAX PRO AM3S AIR PURIFIER ACH o 912,
acility Supplies OWES 945120 945120 AERAMAX PRO AMAS FLR STD ACH o 1,503,
aciity Supplies OWES 928620° 928620 AIR PURIFIER AERAMAX 290, BLACK ACH o 317,
120 acity Supplies WES 932040 932040 AR PURIFIER AERAMAX 200, WHITE ACH 257
121 aciity Supplies WES 928600° EL926600° AR PURIFIER AERAMAX 90,BLACK ACH 171
122 umiture 8511BL SAF8511BL DC MAG WHITEBOARD 42X24X72 BLK ACH 283
123 urniture Quartet 5537 QRTS537 BOARD DRY ERASE,48X72 ALUMINUM ACH 176.
124 umiture Global Upholstery Co. 74823T6TCT4 GLB74823T6TCT4 CHAIR TRITEK HB STANDARD ST ACH 543.
125 umiture Global Upholstery Co. 9336S72LBLK GLBI3IST2LBLK CABINET STORAGE. 72'H BLACK ACH 337,
126 umiture Quarte 5538 QRTS538 BOARD,DRY ERASE,48X96,ALUMINUM ACH 286
127 umiture Giobal Upholstery Co. 3672DPQTM GLBG3672DPQTM DESK,DOUBLE PEDESTAL.72X36.QMY ACH 447,
128 umiture Global Upholstery Co. 0OTG116318 GLBOTG116318 SIX 31,MIDBACK,OPERATOR WIARMS ACH 172.
129 umiture uartet 2307 QRT2307 'BOARD CORK 48X72 ALUMINUM ACH k122
130 uriture Giobal Upholstery Co. MVL2803BLK20 GLBMVL2803BLK20 MED MESH BACK MULTI TILTER ACH 372
131 umiture entry SFW123GDC SENSFW123GDC ELECTRONIC FIRE SAFE ACH 379
132 umiture Giobal Upholstery Co. OTG116138 GLBOTG116138 CHAIR SIX-13 MED BACK CHAIR ACH o 278
133 umiture Global Upholstery Co. OTG116168 GLBOTG116168 CHAIR ALTON,HIGH BACK,TILT ACH o 179
134 umiture arte 'BOARD,CORK,4'X8,ALUMINUM ACH o 247,
135 umiture iobal Upholstery Co 9336572LGRY LB9336572LGRY CABINET STORAGE, 72'H, GREY ACH o 233,
136 umiture jobal Upholstery Co. 93364F THGRY LB93364F 1HGRY FILE LATERAL 4DRAWER 36"W,GY ACH o 526
137 umiture lobal Upholstery Co. MVL2900QL10 LBMVL2900QL10 FULLTIME MID BACK,MULTI TILTER ACH 235
138 umiture lobal Upholstery Co. MVL11860QL10 BMVL118600L10 STRADIC MIDBACK TILTER CHAIR ACH 166.
139 umiture lobal Upholstery Co. 9336S72LNEV. LBI336ST2LNEV CABINET STORAGE 72" ACH 270
umiture lobal Upholstery Co. 93365F 1HBLK LBI3365F1HBLK FILE LATERAL 5DRAWER 36"W.BK ACH 754
umiture lobal Upholstery Co. PCOS2BLK GLBPCOS2BLK COAT TREE, 63" METAL BLACK ACH 60
urniture THE STAPLES COMPANY 52601 STP52601 BERWOOD MESHIFAB TASK CHAIR ACH 756
umiture uartet 50463 QRT59463 EASEL REVERSIBLE 30X41X72 ACH 604
umiture iobal Upholstery Co MVLFRT48 GLBMVLFRT48 TABLE FOLDING,48'X24" RECTANG ACH
uriture Iobal Upholstery Co 0OTG11673 GLBOTG11673 CHAIR FOLDING WHITE ACH
uriture THE STAPLES COMPANY 40346 STP40346 HIGH BACK BONDED MANAGER CHAIR ACH 17
urniture lobal Upholstery Co. OTG116368. GLBOTG116368 GEO CHAIR MED BACK TILTER MESH ACH 1
umiture obal Upholstery Co MVL2781 GLBMVL2781 'ASHMONT MID BACK, TILTER,BLACK ACH 255
umiture iobal Upholstery Co OTG116708 GLBOTG116708 CHAIR TILTER POLY,HIGH BACK BK ACH o 234
150 umiture Union & Scale SUN59385 UNSUN59385 'STOOL BLK ESSENTIAL ACH o 69,
151 umiture Giobal Upholstery Co MVL2748JN02 GLBMVL2748/N0Z STACKING CHAIR MINTO,ARMLESS ACH o 103
152 umiture Safco Products 42248L SAF4224BL HOOK COAT PLASTIC, OVER PANEL ACH o 24
153 umiture Giobal Upholstery Co. MVL2782 GLBMVL2782 CHAIR ASHMONT GUEST,ARWS BLACK ACH o 266.
154 umiture Global Upholstery Co. PCOS3CHM GLBPCOS3CHM COAT TREE, 63" CHROME ACH 100.
155 umiture Safco Products 52888L SAF5288BL SHELVING WIRE 36X24,STARTER BK SET 404,
156 umiture Global Upholstery Co. 966364 GLBIG6364. CHAIR TASK PNEUMATIC,10°GAS EACH 374.
157 umiture Global Upholstery Co. NVL27470N02 GLBMVL2747JN02 STACKING CHAIR MINTO,WIARMS EACH 133
158 P The Staples Company TRS6247 TRUTRS6247 TRU RED DRY ERASE MRK ASST 367 SET 1.
159 P Brother Int Canada Lid TZE231 BRTTZE231 TAPE,CARTRIDGE, 12MM,BKWE ACH
160 P FELLOWES 00772 FELO0772 FILE STORAGE, ECONO,LETTER/LGL ACH
161 P M 202024 MMM202024 TAPE MASKING,SCOTCH,24MMX55M ACH
163 P E) 6541255CY MMMG5412SSCY NOTES, SUPER STICKY 3X3"YELLOW ACK 1 1
164 P Staedter Mars 511100 STD511100 PENCIL SHARPENER, METAL WICATCH ACH
165 P £ 660YW MMMBE0YW PAD,POSTIT,RULED 4X6,YELLOW ACH
166 p NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 81803 SANB1803 CLEANER,BOARD EXPO 2,802 EACH
167 THE STAPLES COMPANY TR56239 TRUTRS6239 MARKER SHARPIE PERM FINE, BLACK BOX il o 44
168 o THE STAPLES COMPANY S46YR5C STPSABYRSC PAD SELF STICK NOTES 4X6,YLW ACK o 3
169 NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 81505 SANB1505 ERASER DRY ERASE ACH o
7 Office Supplies K 6545UC MMMB545UC PAD,POSTIT 33 JAIPUR ACK o 2
Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY KC110 STPKCT10 KC110 8 DIGIT POCKET CALCULATO ACH 9
Office Supplies 202018 MMM202018 TAPE,MASKING SCOTCH, 18MMX55M ACH 1
Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 13362 STP13362 PORTFOLIO,TWIN POCKET RED ACK 1 .7
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13590 STP13590 FILE FOLDERS LETTER YELLOW BOX 700 5.
P First Base Inc 83434 TRUTR56239 CERTIFICATE HOLDER 80LB.NAVY PACK 5
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21024 STP21024 ENVELOPE,CATALOGUE 9X12,FSC X 500
P North American Paper Inc 34220116 NNIR34220116 EASEL PAD.22'X32-7/8".RULED ACH 1
P Hiroy 06364 HRY06364. NOTEBOOK 9 1/2X7 1/4,160 PAGES ACH 1
P KD 563RC MMMS63RC EASEL PAD,POSTIT,SELF ADHESIVE ACH 1 1
180 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 10524 STP10524 PROTECTOR SHEET,TOPLOAD,LETTER BOX 100
181 P uartet 20116 QRT20116 ‘GLASS BOARD MAGNETIC 4X6 EACH 1 389,
182 P FELLOWES 00872 FEL00B72 FILE, STORAGE ENVIRO, LETTERILGL CARTON 2 70.4
183 EN) 654YW MMM654YW PAD,POSTIT,3X3 YELLOW EACH 1 o ¥
184 Canada Inc 0539 AVE05395 LABEL NAME LASER WHITE BOX 400 o 23
185 ison Canada Inc 83507 AVEB3507 HIGHLIGHTER DESKSTYLE,FLUOR YW EACH o .
186 Quartet 20115 QRT20115 BOARD MAGNETIC, 36°X48" WHITE EACH o 14
187 Office Supplies NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 30075PP SAN30075PP MARKER SHARPIE FINE ASSORTED SET 7 o
188 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 17962 STP17962 PENCIL,WOOD, ECONOMY.HB BOX 1
189 Office Supplies 05402 LEP05402 PUTTY,FUN-TAK,56G EACH
190 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 74461 AVE74461 DC NAMETAG KIT-CLIP SOFT3 172 PACK i
191 Office Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY 13860 STP13860 PROTECTOR SHEET, TOPLOAD, CLEAR BOX 700
192 Office Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY S152YR12C STPS152YRIZC NOTES, SELFSTICK,1-3/8X1-7/8.YW PACK 2
193 Office Sup 25146 QRT25146 BOARD DRY ERASE,48X72, ALUMINUM EACH 1 £}
194 Office Sup Dominion Blueline Inc. AB201 DMNAB201 BOOK,RULED, 10 1/4X7 11/16,100P EACH 1 1
195 Office Supplies NUTONE PREMIUM TAPE AzZ241 NTNAZ241 COMPATIBLE BROTHER TZ-241 EACH 1 NO
196 P E 654555UCC MMMB54555UCC PAD,POSTIT SUPERSTICKY, 3X3,RIO PACK o
197 P M 202036 MVIN202036 TAPE,MASKING, SCOTCH 36MMX55M EACH o 27:
198 P uar 35146 QRT35146 BOARD.CORK ECONOMY 48X72AL EACH o 103.4¢
199 P NUTONE PREMIUM TAPE AzZ211 NTNAZ211 COMPATIBLE BROTHER AZ211 EACH B
200 P ixon 13882 DIX13882 PENCIL,WOOD HB, TICONDEROGA BOX bl o
201 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21228 STP21228 OBF 2" BLACK ECONO BINDER ACH 7
202 P Velcro Canada Inc 90090 VEK90090 TAPE,STICKY BACK COIN.WE ACK 7 7:
203 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 30252 DYM30252 LABEL ADDRESS.WHITE ACK 1
204 THE STAPLES COMPANY 17369 STP17369 KIDS 5" BLUNT TIP SCISSORS ACK o
205 Quartet 732230 ORT732230 BOARDDRY ERASE,24X36 ALUMINUM ACH o
206 First Base Inc 83464 FBI83464 ‘CERTIFICATE HOLDER 80L8 BLACK ACK o
207 THE STAPLES COMPANY 22150 STP22150 ‘OST 2 WHITE HVY DTY VIEW BIND ACH o ¥
208 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 05162 AVEOST62 LABEL LASER ADDRESS 4X1 113 ACK 1400 o 231
209 Office Supplies K 566 MMM566 EASEL PAD,PLAIN,20X23 ACK 2%
210 Office Supplies The Staples Company 7972 STP2213 OST 1" WHT STANDARD VIEW BINDE ACH
211 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13376 STP13376 PORTFOLIO, TWIN POCKET BLACK AC
212 P E 653YW MMME53YW PAD,POSTIT. 1 1/2X2.YELLOW AC X
214 P Avery Dennison Canada inc 05309 AVE5309 CARD.TENTFSC3 1/2X11 0 1
215 P STAPLES COMPANY TRS8176 TRUTRS8176 TRU RED MARKER BLACK 12/BX B8O
216 ice Supplies STAPLES COMPANY S33YWiE STPS33YWi8 PAD SELF STICK NOTES,3X3,YLW PAC
217 P 'STAPLES COMPANY TR56236 TRUTR56236 TRU RED PERM TANK MARKER ASST PA
218 P STAPLES COMPANY 17855 STP17855 RUBBER BAND#24-6,1/4L8 B0 1
219 P STAPLES COMPANY 10668 STP10668 BINDER CLIPS, 1 1/4"W,5/8°CAP B0 2 6
220 P ingline 74736 SWi74736 'STAPLER RIO RED ACH 8.7
221 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 15971 STP15971 MAGAZINE FILEWHITE ACK o 1a.
222 NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 95101 PAPS5101 PEN,BALLPOINT FLEX,RET,MED BE ACH o
223 Sharp EL24358 SHREL24358 ‘CALCULATOR HAND HELD,8DIGIT ACH o
224 Casio FX300MSPLUS CSOFX300MSPLUS CALCULATOR SCIENTIFIC10+2,229F ACH o
226 Office Supplies NUTONE PREMIUM TAPE AZ251 NTNAZ251 COMPATIBLE BROTHER TZ-251 ACH o
227 Office Supplies Velcro Canada Inc 90082 VEK90082 TAPE,STICKY BACK 314" ACH
228 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 05161 AVE05161 LABEL,LASER ADDRESS 4X1 ACK 2000 2
229 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 10667 STP10667 BINDER CLIPS,3/4"W.3/8"CAP. ACK 4 o 0.
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230 P Pilot SWPP PILSWPPBK MARKER FINELINER,EXTRAFINE 8K EACH 1 07
231 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 15576 STP15576 FILE FOLDERS LETTER VIOLET BOX 700 15!
232 anada Inc 05159 AVEO5159 LABEL LASER ADDRESS 4X1 112 BOX 1400 o 23
233 Quartet 55900 QRT55900 EASEL FUTURA38" BLACK ACH o 1851
234 THE STAPLES COMPANY 2122 STP2122 BF 1.5°BLACK ECONO BINDER ACH o 3.
235 Office Supplies ELLOWES 3229902 FEL3229902 SHREDDER FELLOWES SB99CI, CONFE ACH o 551.
236 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 22156 STP22156 OST 4" WHITE HVY-DTY VIEW BIND ACH a.
237 Office Supplies Pentel BL77C PENBL77C PEN.RETRACT.ROLLER ENERGEL BE ACH 1
238 Office Supplies et 25148 QRT25148 BOARD,DRY ERASE 48X36 ALUMINUM ACH 135
239 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 12562 STP12562 CORRECTION TAPE 8.5M ACK .

4 P 736348 QRT736348 BOARD.CORK ECONOMY,36X48, AL ACH 1.
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13594 STP13594 FILE FOLDERS,LEGAL,BLUE BOX 100 19.
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13377 STP13377 PORTFOLIO,TWIN POCKET.DK BLUE PACK il
P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11125 AVE11125 INDEX,READY A-ZLETTERAST SET
P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 22474 SAN22474. MARKER FLIP CHART ASSORTED SET
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21224 STP21224 OBL 1" RED BINDER ACH
P Quartet 732347 QRT732347 BOARD,DRY ERASE,36X48 ALUMINUM ACH P
P E) 65317 MMMGS3IT PAD,POST-IT,RECYCLED,1.6X2,YE ACK 2
E) AKT90LE MMMAKTIOLE TRAY KEYBOARD,ADJUSTABLE BLACK EACH o 274
THE STAPLES COMPANY 153 STP22153 OST 3" WHTE HVY DTY VIEW BINDE ACH o Z
250 Avery Dennison Canada Inc 05164 AVEOS164 LABEL LASER ADDRESS 3 1/3X4 ACK 600 o 2.
251 THE STAPLES COMPANY 20657 STP20657 FILE STORAGE, LETTER/LEGAL ACK 20 o 29
252 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 38221 STP38221 FILE FOLDERS,LEGAL IVORY OX 100 o 15
253 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 22144 STP22144 OST 1" WHITE HVY DUTY VIEW BND ACH
254 Office Supplies NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 38201 SAN38201 MARKER SHARPIE PERMANENT BLACK ACH
255 Office Supplies 20114 QRT20114 BOARD,GLASS,MAGNETIC,36'X24" ACH
256 P Dominion Blueline Inc. A79601 DMNA79601 BOOK,RULED, 10X8,200PAGES ACH
257 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 10673 STP10673 MAGNET.1-1/2"-3CM,ASSORTED CLR SET
258 P Texas Instruments TI30XAE TEXTISOXAE CALCULATOR-TI 10 DGT SCIE EACH X
259 P FELLOWES 07243 FEL07243 FILE STORAGE R KIVE LTRILGL BE BOX 1 a
260 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 78617 AVE78617 BADGE,NAME,LASER, CLIP BOX 7 3:
261 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 46250 STP46250 FILE FOLDERS LETTER ASSORTED BOX 100 1
262 P Dominion Blueline Inc. A9l MNAS BOOK LAB, 10 1/2X8,200PAGES EACH 1
263 P Bic Incorporated WOTAPP11 BICWOTAPP11 CORRECTION TAPE,WITEOUT.CTRG EACH 1
264 P Quartet 35148 QRT35148 BOARD, CORK ECONOMY 48X96,AL EACH 1 28
265 Quartet 5534 QRTS534 BOARD,DRY ERASE 34 438X48 ALUM EACH 1 o iz
266 THE STAPLES COMPANY 38220 STP38220 FILE FOLDERS LETTER, IVOR) BOX 700 o 12
267 K 84572 MMIMB4572 TAPE BOOK, 76.2MMX13.7M,CLEAR EACH o 8.
268 THE STAPLES COMPANY 5393 TP25393 MAGNETIC DRYERASE BOARD 71X47 ACH o 68
269 Office Supplies M 4621R4SSNRP MVIN462TRASSNRP PIN SST00R 4X6 4PK WANDERLUST ACK o 7
270 Office Supplies Swingline 7010014 SWIGT010014 'SWINGLINE CLASS 15 GUILT 1 ACH 37,
271 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 50842 STP50842 OBL 1" BLACK BINDER ACH .
272 P E 8108PK MMM8108PK MAGIC TAPE.19MMX21.5M ACK 0.
73 P £ 65424SSCPC MMM65424SSCPC PAD.SUPER STICKY.3X3,CANARY BOX 2 20
4 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc LABEL LASER ADDRESS,2 5/8X1 ACK 750
P M 653AN MMMBS3AN PAD,POSTIT, 1 1/2X2.CAPE TOWN ACK il
P Pentel BLTIA PENBL77A PEN RETRACT.ROLLER ENERGEL BK ACH
P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 05167 AVEO5167 LABEL,LASER ADDRESS, 1 3/4X1/2 ACK 8000 2
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 24548 STP24548 STAPLER,DESK,FULL STRIP,BLACK ACH
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 22134 STP22134 15" WHT STANDARD VIEW BNDR ACH
280 P E) 68455SPL MMME845SSPL NOTES,POST IT8X6 LINED ACK
281 P £ 6545PK MMMB545PK PAD,POSTIT,3X3,NEON,CAPE TOWN ACK
282 Bic Incorporated GSM11BE BICGSM11BE PEN,BALLPOINT,ROUNDSTICK MEDBE BOX o X
283 o ua 59961 QRT59961 MARKER WHITEBOARD, ASSORTED SET o 7
284 NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 33111 PAP33111 PEN,BALLPOINT,STICK MEDIUM,BE BOX o
285 Office Supplies uartet 732123 QRT732123 BOARD,DRY ERASE, 18X24 ALUMINUM EACH o
286 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 21019 STP21019 ENVELOPE #10 WINDOW,FSC BOX 500
267 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 13567 STP13567 FILE FOLDERS LETTER RED BOX 100
288 Office Supplies G.B.C. Canada Inc. 3125913E2 GBC3125913EZ LAMINATOR FILM,12"X200' 3MIL BOX
289 P wingline 87840 SWi7840 STAPLER.DESKTOP.FLAT CLINCH EACH
250 P uracel 5007480 DUR5007480 BATTERY,PROCELL ALKALINE.C BOX il
291 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 17898 STP17898 BINDER CLIP,1-5/8"W,7/8"CAP. BOX il k
292 P 67E QRT67E PRESENTATION EASEL EACH 766.
293 P 33950 UBC339508X SIGNO 207 RET.PEN 0.7M BK 128X BOX bl bl
294 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13596 STP1359 FILE FOLDERS,LEGAL YELLOW BOX 100 2
295 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 221487 STP22148A OST 15" WHT HVY DTY VIEW BIND ACH
29 P 84541 MMIMB4548 TAPE BOOK 50.8MMX13.7M,CLEAR ACH
297 P Dixon 8071 DIX80719 MARKER, WASHABLE PRANG, FINE AST ACK
298 Conros Corporation 5635° CNS56351 TAPE ALL PURPOSE AP1,100M,CL ACK o
299 Hiroy 0601 HRY06011 PORTFOLIO, 11X8.5,GREY ACH o X
300 THE STAPLES COMPANY 4625 STP46251 FILE FOLDERS LEGAL ASSORTED 10X 700 o 7
301 £ R3306SSCYC MMMR33065SCYC PAD, SUPER STICKY,3X3, CANARY ACK o
302 Office Supplies Staedtler Mars 511638K STD511638K 'SHARPENER,PENCIL PLASTIC ACH o
303 Office Supplies STAPLES COMPANY 21568 STP21568 BADGE HOLDER WISTRING ACK k]
304 Office Supplies STAPLES COMPANY 13612 STP13612 ERASER DRY ERASE BOARD ACH
305 Office Supplies STAPLES COMPANY 55552 TRUSS5552 TR 8" STAINLESS STEEL SCIS 2/P ACK E
306 P STAPLES COMPANY ST62146CA STPST62146CA OST 15SHT CROSSCUT SHREDDER ACH 123,
307 P STAPLES COMPANY S35YR12C STPS35YR12C PAD SELF STICK NOTES,3X5,YLW ACK il
308 P STAPLES COMPANY S33BRP12 STPS33BRP12 PAD,POP-UP 33 BRIGHTS ACK il
309 P STAPLES COMPANY 32436 STP32436 STAPLES WALL CLOCK 10" ACH
P SupremeX 4200420FSCNL ‘SMX4200420FSCNL ENVELOPE COIN.2 1/2X4 114 KFT 10X 1000 64
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 862 STP18628 WALL POCKET,UNBREAKABLE,LTR,CL EACH bl
P E 660RPA MMMG60RPA PAD POST-IT,RECYCLED 4X6 PACK 1
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 7897 STP17897 BINDER CLIP, 1"WIDE,7/16"CAP. BOX 1
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 1059 STP10596 CLIPMAGNETIC,1 3/4" ACK 7
£ DL951 MMMDLO51 LAMINATOR REFILL,CTRG,8 112" EACH o 54.
Bic Incorporated BLP5T BICBLP51 HIGHLITER BRITELINER ASSORTED ACK o ¥
EL2630PIIl SHREL2630PIl CALCULATOR DESK PRINTING, 12DGT EACH o 09
Dominion Blueline Inc A10300BLK DMNAT03008LK NOTEPRO,JOURNAL,10.75X8.5,300P ACH o X
Office Supplies Storex 61508 STX61508 FILE, TOTE LETTER/LEGAL CLEAR ACH o 7
320 Office Supplies 701025 DIX701025 ERASER VINYL,WHITE PEARL ACK
321 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 3980 TP13980 STENO BOOK,6°X9", 120 PAGES ACK il
322 P Dominion Blueline Inc. AF1115081 DMNAF 1115081 NOTEBOOK, 11°X8.5"BLACK ACH
323 P Dominion Blueline Inc. AF915081 DMNAF915081 NOTEBOOK9.25"X7.25" BLACK ACH
324 P Pentel BKI0C PENBKI0C PEN,BALLPOINT.FINE,BLUE ACH
325 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 30653PP ‘SAN30653PP FINE TIP PERMANENT MARKERS ACK
326 P M 653RPYW. MMM653RPYW. PAD,POST-IT, 1.5X2,RECYCLED,YEL ACK bl
327 P TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 534G PFX1534G FILE POCKET,6GUSSET LETTER ACH
328 P d Inc (U 602PK UHU99602PK BLUE STICKS, 21GR BLUE, 12PK ACK bl 2
329 P Pilot BLFRPSBEBX PILBLFRPSBEBX FRIXION POINT .7MM BLU 12/8X 10X 1 bl
330 P Wilson Jones 11795 SHEET PROTECTOR 11", BOX
331 P THE STAPLES COMPANY TR56241 TRUTRS6241 TRU RED DRY ERASE FINE BLK 4/P ACK
332 Pentel BK90A PENBK90A PEN,BALLPOINT FINE,BLACK ACH o
333 Swingline 31001 SWi31001 STAPLER,DESK,FULL STRIP,BLACK ACH o
334 Dominion Blueline Inc A79020001 DMNA79020001 BOOK RULED,12X8,200PAGES ACH o £
335 Office Supplies K 810R1833RC MMM810R1833RC TAPE MAGIC, TOWER, 19MMX33M AC 4 o 31
336 Office Supplies G.8.C. Canada Inc. 3745022 GBC3745022 POUCH.LAMINATING LETTER 3MIL AC 100 29
337 Office Supplies TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 2138 0OXD2138 INDEX BINDER OFFICE LETTERSTAB SE 1
338 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 20708 STP20708 FILE FOLDERS LETTER, ORANGE BOX 100 6.
339 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 95301 PAP95301 PEN.FLEXGRIP.RETRACT. MED. BLK ACH
340 P E) 655 MMMBS5 PAD,POST-IT,3X5".YELLOW ACK il
341 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21229 STP21229 OBL 1" LIGHT BLUE BINDER ACH
342 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 83504 AVEB3504 HIGHLIGHTER DESKSTYLE FLUOR GN ACH o
343 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 70005056208 STP70005056208 STAPLES INVISIBLE TAPE ACH YES
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APPENDIX B - RATES
Supplier: Staples Canada ULC, doing business as Staples Professional
For Colleges, Universiiss and. 12 products, please contact your Stapl to have those items added onto your core st
7 P Acme Ruler 3825 ACM38258 RULER PRIMARY,CLEAR,CM ONLY EACH
P 66035SCY MMM6603SSCY PAD,POST IT,RULED 4°X6",YELLOW PACK
NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 33001 SAN33001 MARKER SHARPIE SUPER BLACK EACH o
Papermate 63301 PAP63301BX PN CMFRTMTE RT 1.0 BLK 12PK 10X A o
Hiroy 06249 COVER REPORT DUOTANG,ASSORTED EACH o X
Office Supplies SupremeX 7500420FSCNZ SMX7500420FSCNZ ENVELOPE, CATALOGUE, 15X18 KRAFT OX 250 o 136
350 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 5911 AVE05911 BUSINESS CARD,LASER2X3 1/2WE BOX 2500 5
351 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11129 AVE11129 INDEX,READY.1-31.LETTER AST SET
352 Office Supplies NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 30002 SAN30002 MARKER SHARPIE PERM.FINE.RED ACH
353 P THE STAPLES COMPANY ENOTCR STPENO1CR ENVELOPE POLY.9.5X13.CLEAR ACK
354 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21605 STP21605 OST 15" LGT BLUE STND BIN ACH
355 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 841925 STP841925 ENVELOPE 13X9 7/8 ASSORTED ACH
356 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 83503 AVEB3503 HIGHLIGHTER DESKSTYLE,FLUOR BE ACH
357 P Pilot BXVSPE PILBXVSPE PEN,ROLLER HITEC,V5 EXTRAFN,PE ACH
358 P Sanford 32001 SAN320018X 'SHARPIE TWIN FN/UF BLK 12PK 10X bl 1
359 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 066 STP10669 BINDER CLIP,2'W,1"CAP 10X 1
360 P THE STAPLES COMPANY TR55954 TRUTR55954 TRU RED BALLPOINT MED 1.0, BLU BOX 1
361 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 30003 SAN30003 MARKER SHARPIE PERM,FINE BLUE ACH
362 635 MMMG35 ACK A o bl
363 Bic Incorporated WOFQD12 BICWOFQD12 CORRECTION FLUID,70Z WHITE ACH o
364 THE STAPLES COMPANY 22128 STP22128 /2" WHT STD VIEW BINDER ACH o
365 Bic Incorporated RLCT1BE BICRLCT1BE PEN,GEL RETRACT BLUE ACH o
366 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11437 AVET1437 INDEX MAKER LASER 8TAB WHITE ACK o
367 Office Supplies Bic Incorporated GSMG11BE BICGSMG11BE PEN,BALLPOINT,ROUNDSTICK MEDBE BOX il
368 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY TR56248 TRUTRS6248 TRU RED TANK HIGHLIGHTER YEL § PACK 84
369 Office Supplies Pilot SWPPBE PILSWPPBE MARKER FINELINER, EXTRAFINE BE EACH
370 P Pentel BK440C PENBK440C PEN,BALLPOINT.RETRACT. MED BLUE BOX il
i) P CRAYOLA 663009 BING63009 SCISSORS,BLUNT TIP,METAL EACH o
372 P E) 810R1233 MMM810R1233 TAPE MAGIC,12.7MMX32.9M EACH YES
73 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 17853 STP17853 RUBBER BAND,ASSORTED, 1/4L8 BOX 0
Z P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13379 STP13379 PORTFOLIO,TWIN POCKET,GREEN PACK bl
P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 33211 PEN BALLPOINT,STICK MEDIUM,RD BOX bl
P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 83506 HIGHLIGHTER DESKSTYLE FLUOR OR EACH
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21612 T 2' BLUE STANDARD BINDER EACH
P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 33311 PEN,BALLPOINT,STICK MEDIUM,BK BOX A
Canada Inc 11520 INDEX READY,10TAB,LETTER AST PACK o i
380 Avery Dennison Canada Inc ti27 INDEX,READY MONTH,ASSORTED SET o
381 THE STAPLES COMPANY 18275 PEN,BALLPOINT,FINE,BLUE BOX q o
382 THE STAPLES COMPANY 51820P10D STP51820P10D DISP TAPE T9MMX21.5M, 10PK ACK k] o
383 Office Supplies NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 30004 004 MARKER SHARPIE PERM,FINE GREEN ACH o
384 Office Supplies Dixon 31900PK DIX31900PK DIXON CORRECTION FLUID 12 ACH
385 Office Supplies Pilot SWPPRD PILSWPPRD MARKER FINELINER EXTRAFINE RD ACH X
386 P Pilot BXVSBKBX PILBXVSBKBX ITEC V5 BLK 12PK ACH 13.
387 P an 50573 GBC50573 BADGE CLIP,RETRACTABLE.GREY ACH
388 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 95601 PAP95601 PEN.BALLPOINT FLEX RET FINE BE ACH
389 P Pentel BKITC PENBK91C PEN.RSVP,MEDIUM,BLUE ACH X
390 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11197 AVE11197 INDEX,READY MLTPK,1-15,LETTER ACK 1
391 P Pilot BXVSTE PILBXVSTE PEN,ROLLER, HITEC,V5, EXTRAFN, T ACH
392 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11135 AVE11135 INDEX,READY,1-10,LETTER AST SET
393 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21604 STP21604 OST 15" BLUE STANDARD BINDER EACH
394 P Dixon 87110 DIX871108X REDIMARK MARKER CHISEL RED 12/ BOX A
395 P Papermate 63101BX PAPG3101BX PM CMFRTMTE RT 1.0 BLU 12PK BOX
39 THE STAPLES COMPANY 90023 STP90023 TAB, HANGING FOLDER,2",CLEAR PACK o
397 o entel BKA40A PENBK440A PEN BALLPOINT RETRACT, MED,BK BOX A o
398 EBf 46810 ZEB46810 PEN GEL RETRACT, 7MM BLACK EACH o
399 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 1143 AVETT143 INDEX,READY, 1-15 LETTER AST SET o
400 Office Supplies ZEBRA 46820 ZEB46820 PEN,GEL RETRACT,.7MM.BLUE EACH
401 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11518 AVE11518 INDEX,READY 5TAB.LETTER AST PACK
402 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11447 11447 INDEX MAKER LASER 8TAB.WHITE BOX 2 El
403 P Bic Incorporated GSMG11BK BICGSMG11BK PEN,BALLPOINT.ROUNDSTICK MEDBK BOX 1
404 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 89466 PAP89466 PEN PROFILE,RETRACTABLE BLUE ACH X
405 P 658 MMMB58 TAPE COVER UP.POSTIT, 1X700 ACH 1
406 P Bic Incorporated GSF11BE BICGSF11BE PEN.BALLPOINT,ROUNDSTICK,FNBE OX il 5
207 P SWSLYE PILSWSLYE HIGHLIGHTER, SPOTLITER YELLOW ACH 7
408 P Dixon 871808X DIX87180BX REDIMARK MARKER CHISEL BLUE 12 ACH 1
409 P THE STAPLES COMPANY TR55955 TRUTR55955 TRU RED BALLPOINT MED BLK12/8X BOX 1
7 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 95801 PAP95601 PEN BALLPOINT FLEX RET FINE BK EACH
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 13386 STP13386 REPORT COVERS, TWIN POCKET 8LK PACK 1
THE STAPLES COMPANY TR56229 TRUTRS6229 TRU RED PERM TANK BLACK, 5PK PACK o
TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA CR213 OXDCR213 INDEX BINDER A-Z LETTER SET o
Bic Incorporated MS11BEBX BICMS11BEBX BALLPNT CLASIC MED BLU 128X BOX o
THE STAPLES COMPANY TR66250 TRUTRS6250 TRU RED HIGHLIGHTER PEN YEL 12 PACK A o
Office Supplies Lo\ 07224 FELO7224 FILE MAGAZINE, LIFE SIZE EACH o
Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 1133 AVE11133 INDEX,READY.1-8.LETTERAST SET
Office Supplies NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 96101 PAP96101 PEN,BALLPOINT FLEXGRIP MED. BE EACH X
Office Supplies Dixon 871708X DIX87170BX REDIMARK MARKER CHISEL BLACK 1 BOX il 15
420 P Acme Ruler 22018 ACM22018 SCISSORS, ECONOMY. &' ACH
421 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 96601 PAP96601 PEN.BALLPOINT FLEXGRIP.FINE BE ACH
422 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21600 STP21600 OST 1" BLK STANDARD BINDER ACH .
23 P Davis Group. 23110306 RGO23110306 'ROUND RING BINDER 6PK (RED 1) ACK 2
224 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 18837 STP18837 PENBALL POINT RETRACT GRIP.BE ACH 2
425 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21599 STP21599 OST 1" BLUE STANDARD BINDER ACH il
a2 P Dixon 31144 DIX31144 CHALK DUSTLESS WHITE ACK bl
a1 P Bic Incorporated GSMT1RD. BICGSM11RD PEN BALLPOINT,ROUNDSTICK MEDRD 10X il
428 P ford Corp. 0143 UBC601438X UNI ONYX PEN 0.7MM BLACK 128X BOX bl
429 NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 9465 PAP89465 PEN,BALLPOINT,RETRACT,  4MM,BK EACH o
430 Acme Ruler 1211 ACM11211 BINDER CLIP,3/4"W,3/8°CAP BOX A o
431 Avery Dennison Canada Inc 1436 AVE11436 INDEX MAKER LASER 5TAB,WHITE PACK o
432 TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA CR21312 OXDCR21312 INDEX BINDER JANUARY-DEC LTR SET o
433 Office Supplies Sanford Corp. 60040 UBC60040BX UNI ONYX PEN 0.5MM BLACK 128X BOX il o
a3 Office Supplies Avery Dennison Canada Inc 11519 AVE11519 INDEX,READY 8TAB LETTERAST PACK
435 Office Supplies Sanford Corp. 60145 UBC60145BX UNI ONYX PEN 0.7MM BLUE 128X BOX il
436 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 96301 PAP96301 PEN,BALLPOINT FLEXGRIP.MED.BK EACH
437 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 14881 STP14881 INDEX BINDER 1-10.LETTERWHITE SET
438 P NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 96801 PAP96E01 PEN.BALLPOINT FLEXGRIPFINE.BK ACH
439 P UNIBALL 600418X UBC60041BX UNI ONYX PEN 0.5MM BLUE 128X 0
P Sanford Corp 60042 UBC60042BX UNI ONYX PEN 0.5MM RED 12/B0X 0
Py Sanford Corp. 60144 UBCB0144BX. UNI ONYX PEN 0.7MM RED 12/BOX 05
P Sanford Corp. 60101 UBCA0101BX UNI-BALL PEN 0.7MM BLACK 12/80 BO; bl
P THE STAPLES COMPANY TRS6251 TRUTRS6251 TRU RED HIGHLIGHT ASST 5/PK PAC
P THE STAPLES COMPANY TRE5956 TRUTR55956 PEN,BALLPOINT ROUNDSTICK MEDBK B0
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 342115 STP342115 ARVIEW TAPE 48MMX50M A 1
THE STAPLES COMPANY 5775 STP15775 COVERS, TANG DARK BLUE ACH o
Pilot BPSFRD PILBPSFRD PEN BALLPOINT STICK,FINE RED ACH o
Acco 725808X /ACC72580BX PAPER CLIPS # JUMBO ACK 1000 o
Office Supplies 20312X55 MMM20312X55 GENERAL PURPOSE MASKING TAPE ACH o
450 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 22299 STP22299 CLIPBOARD 9X 12 MASONITE ACK
451 Office Supplies TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 67505 OXD67505 TWINPOCKET COVER, LETTER GREY ACH
452 Office Supplies TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 67504 OXD67504 TWINPOCKET COVER LETTER WHITE ACH
453 Office Sup THE STAPLES COMPANY TR55957 TRUTRS5957 PEN,BALLPOINT ROUNDSTICK MEDBE BOX il
454 P SWSLPK PILSWSLPK HIGHLIGHTER, SPOTLITER PINK EACH
455 P Pilot SWSLGN PILSWSLGN HIGHLIGHTER SPOTLITER GREEN EACH X
456 Acco 716138X ACCT16138X CLIP BULLDOG MAGNETIC 2" BOX 2 31.
257 BERRCOMM IXB178 FADJXB178 NON-CONTACT INF THERMOMETER EACH 3
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Supplier: Staples Canada ULC, doing business as Staples Professional
Category A - Price List Effective Date: April 1
Master Agreement Start Da
Master Agraement Expiry D:
For Colleges, Universis, and. 5 interested n K-12 products, please contact your Staple: to have those items added onto your core st
458 PPE CROWNHILL FACESHIELD CLLFACESHIELD PROTECTIVE FACESHIELD CARTON a8 285.07
459 Dentec Safety Specialists 22521 DTS22521 SAFETY GOGGLES SPLSH 6PRS/PK PACK 12 38.4¢
460 PRO CLEAN CL2000 PIFCL2000 SANITIZER GEL 1000ML EACH 1 o 47
461 orcefiel 00772202PFMG LLD00772202PFNIG GLOVE VINYL,POWDER FREE MEDIUM 10X 700 o 8.
462 Office Santtization orcefiel TVIPKTA LLDTV3PKTA VEST 5 PT TEARAWAY,ORANGE EACH 1 o 0.
463 Office Sanitization orcefiel 00777702WM LLD00777702WM ‘GLOVE, PF COBALT BLUE NITRILE CARTON 000 o 66,
464 ice Sanitization orcefiel 00772202FGPF LLD00772202F GPF 'GLOVE.VINYL,FOOD GRADE MED CARTON 1000 58,
465 ice Sanitization orcefiel 0297901 LLD0297901 EAR PLUG HEAR NO EVIL NRR 32 BOX 200 23
466 ice Sanitization orcefiel 00777703WM LLD00777703WM GLOVE PF COBALT BLUE NITRIL CARTON 1000 166.
467 ice Sanitization LATOPLAST 00777703VTPF LLD00777703VTPF GLOVE VINYL NITRILE HYBRID.LRG / 100 PACK 100 T
468 Wasip L 200200 WAS200200 LENS CLEANING TISSUES.ANTIFOG BOX 100
469 VMedCare H19M0030 OLBH19M0030 FACE MASK,LEVEL 1,ADULT,50/8X BOX 1 .
70 Forcefield 00777703INPF LLD00777703INPF ‘GLOVE,FORECEFIELD,TRIO LARGE CARTON 1000 164
an Forcefield 00777702INPF LLD00777702INPF ‘GLOVE,FORCEFIELD, TRIO,MEDIUM CARTON 1000 4
a2 Forcefield 00772201FGPF LLD00772201FGPF ‘GLOVE,VINYL,FOOD GRADE SM CARTON 1000 5
73 El HTA MMMHTA 3M PELTR OPTIME EARMFFS H7A EACH 1 2
Z Wasip Ltd F2527760 WASF2527760 TOWLETTE HYGIENIC/CLEANSING BOX 100
Forcefield 044QM24 LLD044QM24 EARMUFF QM24+24DB NRR25 EACH 1
Forcefield 00758703 LLD00758703 GLOVES NITRIFORCE 6MIL LARGE BOX 1 o 4
umiture Giobal Upholstery Co 126131C74 GLB12613TC74 CHAIR MID BACK,0BUS GREY ACH 1 o 440,
umiture Quartet 20062 QRT20062 BOARD,MAGNETIC 4X6 ACH 1 o 454,
Facility Suppiies Perk PK56339 PKRPK61284 PERK COMP PAPER PLATE 9" 250/F ACK 250 YES 40
480 Office Supplies Lepage 05352 LEP05352 ‘GLUE STICK LARGE 40G ACH YES §
482 Office Supplies harp EL510RTBB SHRELG10RTBB CALCULATOR SCIENTIFIC. 160F ACH YES
483 Office Supplies THE STAP! 19648 STP19648 PENCIL CRAYONS ASSORTED ACK il YES
484 Office Supplies iroy 06237 HRY06237 COVER REPORT DUOTANG,RED ACH YES
485 P 06224 HRY06224 COVER REPORT.DUOTANG GREEN ACH YES
486 P 06204 HRY06204 COVER REPORT.DUOTANG YELLOW ACH YES
287 P Q 789903 QRT3413889903 EASEL PAD.24X36,LINED ACH YES
88 P i 06203 HRY06203 COVER REPORT.DUOTANG,ORANGE ACH YES
89 P 06226 HRY06226 COVER,REPORT.DUOTANG, LIGHT BE ACH YES
290 P 11185P HRY11185P EXERCISE BOOK 8.5X11,5/16,80PG ACK 2 YES bl
291 P CRAYOLA 567708 BIN567708 MARKERS ORIGINAL LARGE ACK bl YES
292 P Hiroy 06209 HRY06209 COVER REPORT DUOTANG,DARK BLUE ACH YES
493 P CRAYOLA 587708 BIN567708 MARKER REGULAR,CONICAL BROADTP ACK YES
494 Hiroy 06235 HRY06235 COVER REPORT, DUOTANG BLACK EACH YES
495 Sanford 80001 SANBO00TBX EXPO CHISEL BLK 12PK BOX A YES
49 Hiroy 06211 HRY06211 'COVER,REPORT DUOTANG,GREY EACH YES
497 NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 80174T ANBOT74T MARKER DRY ERASE, CHISEL,ASSORT ET YES .
498 Office Supplies i 11184P RY11184P EXERCISE BOOK 8.5X11,80PG ACK 2 YES 4.
499 Office Supplies CRAYOLA 567916 BING67916 MARKER WASHABLE ASSORT LARGE ACK k] YES
500 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 54666 STP54666 ‘GLUE STICK 40G ACH YES
501 P 06004 HRY06004 PORTFOLIO,11X8.5.YELLOW ACH YES
502 P CRAYOLA 520008 BIN520008 CRAYONS,CRAYOLA,REG..8/PK ACK YES
503 P Hilroy 06212 HRY06212 COVER REPORT.DUOTANG,WHITE ACH YES
504 P Hilroy 11174P HRY11174P EXERCISE BOOK,1/4"+MRG.40PG ACK 2 YES
505 P CRAYOLA 520016 BIN520016 CRAYONS,CRAYOLA,REGULAR ACK bl YES
506 P i 06006 HRY06006 PORTFOILO,11X8.5,GREEN ACH YES
507 P Hilroy 06007 HRY06007 PORTFOLIO, 11X8.5,RED ACH YES
508 P CRAYOLA 587208 BIN567208 MARKER CRAYOLA,WEDGE TIP ACK YES
509 P anford SANB0002BX MARKER DRY ERASE CHISE RED BOX bl YES
510 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 16554 STP16554 RULER ACRYLIC, 12/30CM EACH YES
511 Sanford 80004 SANB0004BX EXPO CHISEL GRN 12PK BOX A YES
512 o Lepage 05332 LEP05332 ‘GLUE STICK SMALL 10G ACH YES
513 THE STAPLES COMPANY 16522 STP16522 GLUESTICK,20G ACK il YES
514 Office Supplies CRAYOLA 520080 BIN520080 CRAYONS, CRAYOLA, LARGE,8/PK ACK YES
515 Office Supplies Hiroy 06026 HRY06026 PORTFOILO,11X8.5,LIGHT BLUE ACH YES
516 Office Supplies Uad Inc (Uhu) 99653PK UHU99653PK ‘GLUE STICKS.40GR BLUE. 12PK CK il YES il
517 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY TR56240 TRUTR56240 TRU RED DRY ERASE MARK BLK, 4/ ACK YES
518 P North American Paper Inc. C4202828 NMRC4202628 EXERCISE BOOK 8.5X11-5/16,80PG ACK 2 YES
519 P 11985P. HRY11985P EXERCISE BOOK,5/16+MRG 80PG ACK 2 YES
520 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 26272 TP26272 RULER PLASTIC,12" CH YES .37
521 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 18379 TP18379 CLOCKWALL, 14", 12/24HOURS BK ACH YES 7.
522 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 55555 RU55555 POINTED TIP JR 5INCH 2PACK ACK YES
523 P Sanford 80003 SANB0003BX EXPO CHISEL BLU 12PK BOX 1 YES
524 P Hiroy 1715P HRY11715P EXERCISE BOOK,7X9,RULED,40PG PACK 2 YES
525 P ‘Acme Ruler 02208 /ACM02208 SCISSORS, STAINLESS STEEL 8" EACH YES
526 P Hilroy 06005 HRY06005 PORTFOLIO, 11X8.5,DARK BLUE EACH YES
527 CRAYOLA 511406 BIN511406 CHALK WHITE, 144 BOX a4 YES
528 North American Paper Inc C4108428 NMRC4108428 PROJECT BOOK, 1/2PLAIN RBBR, 40P PACK 2 YES
529 Dixon 92140 DIX92140 MARKER DRY ERASE,4COLOUR SET PACK YES
530 THE STAPLES COMPANY 10566 STP10566 TAPE DISPENSER BLACK EACH YES
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531 P Hiroy 11975 HRY11975P EXERCISE BOOK 9X7,8MM 40PG PACK 2 YES
532 P am DL1001 MMMDL1001 LAMINATOR REFILL CTRG, 12" EACH YES EREX
533 North American Paper Inc 1115048 NMR1115048 SCRAP BOOK, 11X15,48 PAGES EACH YES
534 86001 SANBB00TBX EXPO FINE BLK 12PK 10X A YES
535 THE STAPLES COMPANY 11255 STP11255 ERASER VINYLWHITE PACK YES
536 Office Supplies Hiroy 13224 HRY 13224 NOTEBOOK,WIREBOUND, 10 1/2X8 EACH YES
537 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 54410 STP54410 ‘GLUE STICK.9.06 PACK YES
538 Office Supplies NEWELL RUBBERMAID BRANDS 14075 SAN14075 MARKER WET ERASE BRIGHTSTICK SE YES 11.34
539 Office Supplies Hiroy 11175P HRY11175P EXERCISE BOOK,10.9X8.4 5/16°RL PACK 2 YES .
54 P Hilroy 11935P HRY11935P EXERCISE BOOK 9X7.8MM,BLUE PACK 2 YES &l
P Hilroy 11994P. HRY11994P EXERCISE BOOK,9X7,QUAD 1/4” PACK 2 YES 0.1
P Pentel PHN12C PENPHN12C LOIL SET 1 YES .7
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 21846 STP21846 POSTER BOARD,22X28,4 PLY.WHITE EACH YES
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 36530 STP36530 PENCIL,WOOD,GOLF 3 1/2".YELLOW BOX 144 YES
P THE STAPLES COMPANY 10807 STP10807 STAPLE,STANDARD PACK 25000 YES
P E 8104PKC MMMB104PKC TAPE, 19MNIX25M,4 PACK 4 YES
P Hiroy 035 HRY06035 PORTFOLIO11X8.5,BLACK EACH 1 YES
P Canada inc 05305 AVEO5305 ‘CARD, TENT,FSC,LASER 2 1/2X8 1/ B0 700 YES il
iroy 05233 HRY05233 LOOSE-LEAF SHEETS RULED,200SHT A 200 YES
550 iroy 11900P HRY11900P EXERCISE BOOK PLAIN 9X7,40PG A 25 YES
551 THE STAPLES COMPANY 66399 STP66399 SHEEET,LOOSE LEAF,LETTER A 400 YES
552 THE STAPLES COMPANY 90105 STP90105 CARD,INDEX ,RULED,3X5 WHITE A 300 YES
553 Office Supplies North American Paper Inc 1209032 NMR1209032 SCRAP BOOK8 3/6X12,32 PAGES ACH 1 YES
554 Office Supplies Dixon 18995 DIX18995 PENCIL BEGINNERS, MED PRIMARY#2 ACH 1 YES
555 Office Supplies Staedtler Mars. 52650 STD52650 ERASER PLASTIC STANDARD WHITE ACH 1 YES
556 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 17866 STP17866 PAPER CLIPS #1,NON SLIP BOX 100 YES
557 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 18605 STP18605 PAD, GUMMED,WIRULED LTR 50 SH. PACK il YES
558 P Avery Dennison Canada Inc 83509 AVEB3509 HIGHLIGHTER DESKSTYLE,FLUOR.PK EACH YES
559 P STAPLES COMPANY 18590 STP18590 PAD,11"RULED 5/16" WHITE PACK 1 YES
560 P STAPLES COMPANY 10666 STP10666 BINDER CLIPS 9/16"W, 1/4"CAP. 10X [ YES
561 P STAPLES COMPANY 24160 STP24160 BINDER CLIPS ASSRT BLK 60PK 10X YES
562 P STAPLES COMPANY 39417 STP39417 'SCHOOL GLUE 118ML WASHABLE ACH YES
563 P kN 810R1833 MMMB10R1833 TAPE MAGIC, 19MNX32.9M ACH YES
564 P Sotal 312 SOT53127 ERASER PLASTIC.WHITE ACH YES
565 P THE STAPLES COMPANY TR56242 TRUTRS6242 TRU RED DRY ERASE MRK TANK AST ACK YES
566 THE STAPLES COMPANY 7867 STP17867 PAPER CLIPS #1,SMOOTH BOX 700 YES
567 THE STAPLES COMPANY 70005056208 STP70005056208 STAPLES INVISIBLE TAPE ACK YES
568 North American Paper Inc 1209020 NMR1209020 SCRAP BOOK,9X12,20 PAGES EACH YES
569 ixon 18997 DIX18997 PENCIL BEGINNERS,LRG PRIMARY#1 ACH YES
570 Office Supplies ixon 22120 DIX22120 PENCIL,PRANG ASSORTED COLOURS ACK il YES
571 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 17366 STP17366 STUDENT 7" SCISSOR SOFTGRIP ACH YES
572 Office Supplies THE STAPLES COMPANY 496963 STP496963 PAD.QUAD.4SQ/INCH.LETTER 965H ACK YES
573 P Hunt 1031 HUN1031 SHARPENER PENCILNICKEL-PLATED ACH YES
4 P Hilroy 26421 HRY26421 'SCRAP BOOK, 12X10,30SHEETS ACH YES
P TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 31 OXD31 CARD INDEX RULED,3X5, WHITE ACK 100 YES
P Sotal 53312 SOT53312 PIPE CLEANER, 12" ASSORTED ACK 100 YES
P Texas Insiruments TI30XIIS TEXTIBOXIIS CALCULATOR SCIENTIFIC, 10+2DGT ACH YES
P TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 52501 OXD52501 COVER,REPORT,TANG,LETTER,LBE ACH YES
P TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 52511 OXD52511 COVER REPORT, TANG,LETTER,RED ACH YES
580 P Hilroy 12692 HRY12692 EXERCISE BOOK STICHED ACK YES
581 P Hiroy 13129 HRY13129 BOOK COIL EXERCISE, 100PAGES ACH YES
582 P Uad Inc (Uhu) 99601PK UHU99601PK ‘GLUE STICKS,8.2GR,BLUE 24PK ACK 2 YES bl
583 Swingline 35108 SWI35108 STAPLE, STANDARD, 5000/B0X BOX 5000 YES
584 o THE STAPLES COMPANY 10594CA STP10594CA MAGNET TAPE 0.5°X30" BLACK ACH NO
585 imer's 60307W8 EPOG0307WE GLUE,WASH OFF,120ML ACH NO
586 Office Supplies ‘Acme Ruler 20020 ACM20020 RULER ACRYLIC, 12730CM ACH YES
567 Office Supplies Acme Ruler R50185 ACMR50185 RULER WOOD, 12730CM ACH YES
588 Office Supplies CRAYOLA 661104 BING61104 GLUE,PROJECT 402 ACH YES
589 Office Supplies Hiroy 06010 HRY06010 PORTFOLIO,11X8.5 WHITE ACH YES
590 P Deflecto Corporation 77001 DEF77001 RACK,LITERATURE, MAGAZINE CLEAR ACH YES
591 P Uad Inc (Uhu) 9964 UHU99649 GLUE STICK.MEDIUM.21G EA ACH YES
592 P Staedtler Mars. A5685215 STDA5685215 PROTRACTORCOLLEGE. 180DEG.6" ACH YES
593 P THE STAPLES COMPANY 2298 STP22983 ERASER PINK MEDIUM ACK YES
594 P TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 57538 OXD57538 PORTFOLIO,2POCKET,LETTER, DBE ACH YES
595 P TOPS PRODUCTS CANADA 67538 OXD67538 TWINPOCKET COVER,LETTER,NAVY. ACH YES
59 P 725858X ACC725858X PAPER CLIPS #4 JUMBO ACK 1000 YES 2
597 P Lepage 05342 P0534: ‘GLUE STICK MEDIUM,20G ACH YES
598 P North American Paper inc 34220616 NMR34220616 EASEL PAD,22X34,QUAD,1CM ACH YES
599 CRAYOLA 674154 BING74154 SKIN TONED COLOUR PENCILS CT ACK 2 YES
600 CRAYOLA 567709 BIN567709 SKIN TONE LINE MARKERS 24 CNT ACK 2 YES
601 CRAYOLA 521733 BIN521733 [ 2994211 SKIN TONE CRAYONS 24CT ACK 2 I YES
Computer Supplies Sandisk SDCA48032GA46 'SSXSDCAB032GAd6 | USB ULTRA FLASH DRIVE 32G8 EACH [ NO REMOVE - DISCONTINUED
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Colour Domtar 94202 DPP94292 2,058.84 53,529.84
5 X7 241 Colour NIA
6 X7 20LE Canary 90 Domtar 94293 DPP94293 SFI 500 5 40 26 s 27148 13560 | § 542758 | $  141,116.98
X 20LE olour NIA The Staples Company STP073070 STP073070 PEFC 500 10 40 26 s 1083 [$ 110.30 [§ 441200 [ § 11471200
.5 X 2411 olour NIA Domtar 733093 STP733093 FSC 500 10 32 26 s 2368 | § 23678 S 757680 | $ 196,996.80
.5 X 65L1 olour NIA
.5 X 7L Colour NIA Domtar 94342 DPP94342 FSC 250 8 40 20 s 1846 | § 14767 | §  5906.88 | § 118,137.60
.5 X 90LI Colour NIA Domtar 81055 DPP81055 FSC 0 0 0 0 s - [s - s - [ -
X 20LE olour NIA The Staples Company STP073070 STP073070 PEFC 500 10 40 26 s 1083 [ § 11030 [ 8 441200 [ § 11471200
.5 2411 olour NIA
.5 X 65L1 olour NIA Astrobrights AST22731 CDEAST22731 FSC 250 8 40 20 s 2299 [ § 18394 | §  7,357.76 | § 147,155.23
5% 20LE Colour NIA Domtar 1088 PP81088 PEFC Product is "Low on Stock'. rders.
.5 X 2018 olour NIA Domtar 1196 PP81196 PEFC. Product is "Low on Stock'. Pl rders
.5 X 2411 Colour NIA Domtar 1322 PP81322 FSC Product is 'Low on Stock' i
.5 X 7L Colour NIA Domtar 1044 PP81044 FSC Product is "Low on Stoc} rders.
.5 X 90LE Colour NIA Domtar 1055 DPP81055 FSC Product is "Low on Stock'. rders.
.5 X 2018 Colour. NIA omtar 1196 DPP81196 PEFC Product is "Low on Stock'. rders
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1 Hewlett Packard 75% FSC No
2 All Other Manufacturers 65% SClI No
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Black Blue Blue
Blue Buff Buff
Buff Canary Canary
Canary Cherry Cherry
Cherry Cream Cream
Cream Fuchsia Fuchsia
Fuchsia Gold Gold
Gold Green Green
Green Grey Grey
Grey Ilvory Ivory
Ivory Lilac Lilac
Lilac Orange Orange
Orange Pink Pink
Pink Purple Purple
Purple Red Red
Red Salmon Salmon
Salmon Tan Tan
Tan Teal Teal
Teal White White
White Yellow Yellow
Yellow Black Black
Beige




